DEPARTMENT:

Bureau of Purchases

PROPORSAL FOR: B50002251, Citywide Towing Services

OPENING DATE:

RECV'D: 05/09/12
OPENED: 05/09/12

ITEM #1 ITEM #2
C
. . . Bid Check | Date Check Check
A h :
Bidder ddress ﬁtﬂrﬁm U,T;m ﬁﬂnﬁ)m U,T;m Bond |k| Amount | Returned [ Receipt For
2124 Kirk Ave. Referred to Law

Aarons Towing Service

21218 Dept. for Review
Quick Response Towing Inc. gi;zsg Caton Ave. $  1,278,000.00 NO BID
Frankford Towing Assoc. LLC 4519 Harford Rd.
(1box) 21214 $ 1,438,899.00 | $ 74,500.00
Frankford Towing LLC 840 North Point Rd.
(1box) 21237 $ 1,438,800.00 | $ 74,500.00
Frankford Towing Service, LLC 2101 Fleet St.
(1box) 21231 $ 1,438,800.00 | $ 74,500.00

Frankford Towing, Inc.
(1box)

1915 Edison Highway
21213

$ 1,438,800.00

$ 74,500.00

Mel's Towing (1box)

4919 Frankford Ave.
21206

$ 1,438,800.00

$ 74,500.00

Ted's Towing Service, Inc.
(1box)

6300 Belair Rd.
21206

$ 1,438,800.00

$ 74,500.00

5720 Reisterstown Rd.

Bermans Towing 1, LLC 21215 $ 1,436,800.00 NO BID
Bermans Towing 2, LLC Z;g;eismrsmwn Rd. $  1,436,800.00 NO BID
Bermans Towing 3, LLC gzg%ReiSterSto""” Rd. $  1,436,800.00 NO BID
Bermans Towing 4, LLC Z;g;eismrsmwn Rd. $  1,436,800.00 NO BID
Universal Towing gigg;a“re“a Ave. $  1,001,500.00 | $ 42,200.00
Greenwood Towing, Inc. 1370 W. North Ave. $  1,366,500.00 NO BID

21217-3594
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DEPARTMENT:

PROPORSAL FOR: B50002251, Citywide Towing Services

OPENING DATE:

Bureau of Purchases

RECV'D: 05/09/12
OPENED: 05/09/12

ITEM #1 ITEM #2
—TC
Bidder Address |fiol Amount |fid Amount Bid 1| Check Date Check Ch.ECk
Lump || Item Lump || Item Bond |k| Amount Returned [Receipt For
Nate's Towing Service gigi;'be”y Heights Avnue 1,438,800.00 | $ 74,500.00
McDel Enterprises (2env) gigiﬁ Harford Rd. 1,438,800.00 NO BID
. o . 900 York Rd.
Jim Elliott's Towing (4env) Towson, MD 21204 1,438,800.00 NO BID
. . 810 Spedden St. Referred to Law
Cherry Hill Towing (2boxes) 21216 Dept. for Review
Cherry Hill Towing I, LLC (2boxes) ;22 f%he"y Hill Rd. 1,438,800.00 | $ 74,500.00
Cherry Hill Towing Il, LLC 1951 Benhill Ave.
(bores 21996 NOTOTAL | $ 74,500.00
2930 James St. Referred to Law
The Auto Bam, Inc. 21230 Dept. for Review
The Auto Barn I, LLC (2boxes) gig;w - Lafayette Ave. 1,458,800.00 | $ 74,500.00
The Auto Barn II, LLC (2boxes) gigg;rankford Ave. 1,458,800.00 | $ 74,500.00
The Auto Barn Ill, LLC (2boxes) |2°+/ Belair Rd. 1,458,800.00 | $ 74,500.00

21236
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DEPARTMENT:

Bureau of Purchases

PROPORSAL FOR: B50002398, Skid Steer Loader With Attachments

OPENING DATE:

RECV'D: 05/09/12
OPENED: 05/09/12

Bidder

Address

Amount

i
Lump Item

Bid
Bond

Check
Amount

Date Check
Returned

Check
Receipt For

8031 Norris Ln.

Correlli Incorporated 21299 $ 89,468.00
. . 14420 Howard Rd.
J. David Mullinix and Sons Inc. Dayton, MD, 21036 $ 98,731.00
. . 11212 York Rd.

Finch Services, Inc. Hunt Valley, MD 21030 $ 87,625.70
Security Equipment Company g?g;\Nashmgton Blvd $ 92,433.00
8411 Pulaski Highway
JESCO, Inc. 21937 $ 89,289.00
Metro Rentals Inc. 1100 Pulaski Hwy. $ 91,147.00

White Marsh, MD




DEPARTMENT:
PROPORSAL FOR:

OPENING DATE:

Bureau of Purchases

B50002381, Five-Ton Crew Cab Dump Truck

RECV'D: 05/02/12
OPENED: 05/02/12

Bidder

Address

i

Amount
mp Item

Bid
Bond

Check
Amount

Date Check
Returned

Check
Receipt For

Beltway International, LLC

1800 Sulphur Spring Rd.
21227

$

458,097.00

Chesapeake Ford Truck Sales,

Inc.

8540 Pulaski Highway
21237

$

405,073.00




DEPARTMENT:
PROPORSAL FOR:

OPENING DATE:

Bureau of Purchases

B50002312, Unarmed Uniformed Security Guard Services

RECV'D: 04/25/12
OPENED: 04/25/12

Bidder

Address

|fiol Amount
Lump Item

Bid
Bond

Check
Amount

Date Check
Returned

Check
Receipt For

FJC Security Services, Inc.
(1box)

275 Jericho Turnpike
Floral Park, NY, 11001

$ 10,911,360.00

U. S. Security Associates, Inc.

6666 Security Blvd.
21207

$ 11,300,160.00

C&D Enterprises, Inc., d/b/a
C&D Security (1box)

306 N. Delaware Drive
Colorado Springs, CO, 80909

$ 11,416,620.00

Watkins Security Agency, Inc.

2901 Druid Park Dr., Suite A 106
21215

$ 11,328,240.00

Abacus Corporation

610 Gusryan Street
21224

$ 10,683,000.00

AlliedBarton Security Services
(5evn)

7939 Honeygo Blvd, Suite 203
21236

Referred to Law
Dept. for Review

G4S Secure Soltuions (USA), Inc.

609 Global Way, Ste 116
Linthicum, MD 21090

$ 12,420,780.00

Red Coats, Inc. d/b/a
Admiral Security Services

1010 Park Ave., Suite 100
21201

$ 11,405,996.00




DEPARTMENT:

PROPORSAL FOR: B50002370, TV Unit Camera Equipment

OPENING DATE:

Bureau of Purchases

RECV'D: 04/25/12
OPENED: 04/25/12

Bidder

Address

i

Amount
mp Item

Bid
Bond

Check
Amount

Date Check
Returned

Check
Receipt For

2686 Garfield Ave.

Atlantic Machinery, Inc. Silver Spring, MD 20910 $ 67,941.00
. . 159 Colonial Ave.

RS Technical Services, Inc. Albany, NY 12208 $ 73,841.96

Maryland Industrial Trucks 1330 West Nursery Road $ 69,210.00

Linthicum, MD, 21090




DEPARTMENT: Bureau of Purchases
PROPORSAL FOR: B50002385, Aluminum Sheets (5052-H38)

OPENING DATE:

RECV'D: 04/25/12
OPENED: 04/25/12

Bidder

Address

i

Amount
mp Item

Bid
Bond

Check
Amount

Date Check
Returned

Check
Receipt For

10528 Flamewood Dr.

Goodrum International Fort Worth, TX 76140 $ 83,300.00
Custom Products Co. i;issiﬁwl\;’gd;;?)z $ 70,224.00
Shannon-Baum Signs, Inc. é?;ez%r:%?t:\j\ée Sf;gim' $ 83,300.00
US Standard Sign éi:r?lgiﬁ‘id;ﬁ n Ift 50131 $ 68,334.00
Vulcan Aluminum 408 E. Berry Ave. $ 64,505.00

Foley, AL, 36536




DEPARTMENT: Bureau of Purchases
PROPORSAL FOR: B50002386, Recreational Vehicle and Motor Home Repairs

RECV'D: 04/25/12

OPENING DATE: 5oeNeD: 04/25/12

Bid Check Date Check Check

i h
ﬁﬁ,ﬁm U,T;m Bond |k| Amount Returned Receipt For

Bidder Address

RECEWED

!

o)
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